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Tandus Centiva Gives Back to Local Community  
People with Purpose 

 

Dalton, GA (November 17, 2015) – Tandus Centiva, a Tarkett company, provides the opportunity for its 
Dalton, GA employees to demonstrate the company’s commitment to supporting community 
organizations and causes.  As part of their first annual Day of Service, Tandus Centiva partnered with 
United Way and employees installed ethos® Modular carpet at the local Salvation Army, Whitfield Dalton 
Day Care, Cohutta Elementary School and Oak Haven Second Chance Home. Tandus Centiva ethos is a 
time-tested flooring solution that is perfect for education facilities, corporate offices and public spaces.  It 
is a high performance modular carpet tile made from PVB, a recycled film polymer which is found in 
windshields and safety glass. 
 
“Tandus Centiva strives to be a positive force in our local communities,” states Erin Istanbulluoglu, 
Director of Environmental & Social Stewardship for Tandus Centiva.  “United in our team efforts, we are 
thankful to provide a time-tested, high performance, sustainable flooring solution for these facilities.” 
 
For more information on Tandus Centiva, ethos and People with Purpose initiatives, please visit 
https://www.tandus-centiva.com/tcmedia/whats-new. 
 
About Tandus Centiva 
Tandus Centiva’s unique line of Powerbond®, Modular, Broadloom, Woven and LVT flooring products 
offer a true fit-for-purpose approach to enhance spaces for learning, working, healing and living. With 
industry-leading product design, unrivaled service and a commitment to environmental and social 
stewardship, Tandus Centiva, a Tarkett company, provides the ultimate flooring experience for 
commercial customers.  For more information, please visit tandus-centiva.com. 
 
About Tarkett 
Tarkett is a global leader in innovative and sustainable solutions for flooring and sports surfaces. Offering 
a wide range of products including vinyl, linoleum, carpet, rubber, wood & laminate, synthetic turf and 
athletic tracks, the Group serves customers in more than 100 countries worldwide. With 12,000 
employees and 34 industrial sites, Tarkett sells 1.3 million square meters of flooring every day, for 
hospitals, schools, housing, hotels, offices, stores and sports fields. Committed to sustainable 
development, the Group has implemented an eco-innovation strategy and promotes circular economy. 
Tarkett’s net sales of 2.4 billion euros in 2014 are balanced between Europe, North America and the region 
comprising CIS countries, APAC & LATAM. Tarkett is listed on Euronext Paris (compartment A, ticker 
TKTT, ISIN: FR0004188670). www.tarkett.com 
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